BOARD OF SUPERVISORS MADISON COUNTY, MISSISSIPPI

Department of Engineering 3137 South Liberty Street, Canton, MS 39046
Tim Bryan, P.E., County Engineer Office (601) 790-2525 FAX (601) 859-3430
MEMORANDUM
July 27, 2020

To:  Sheila Jones, Supervisor, District |
Trey Baxter, Supervisor, District 11
Gerald Steen, Supervisor, District 111
Karl Banks, Supervisor, District IV
Paul Griffin, Supervisor, District V

From: Tim Bryan, P.E.
County Engineer

Re:  Acknowledgement of Final Payment
Madison County Board of Supervisors v Dick Hall, et al
Hinds County Circuit Court No. 251-10-432 CIV

On behalf of the Mississippi Transportation Commission, the Engineering Department is requesting that
the Board acknowledge the receipt of $42,157.88 which is the full and final payment of the settlement
agreement made between the Mississippi Transportation Commission and the Board of Supervisors of
Madison County for the above referenced litigation.
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Transportation Division

DANIEL B. SMITH
SPECIAL ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

June 25, 2020

Mr. Ronny Lott, Clerk

Madison County Board of Supervisors
P.O. Box 404

Canton, MS 39046

Re: Madison County Board of Supervisors v. Dick Hall, et al
Hinds County Circuit Court No. 251-10-432 CIV

Dear Mr. Lott:

MDOT is processing payment in the amount of $42,157.88 unto Madison County that will cause an
electronic transfer from the Department of Finance and Administration. This amount is final payment
on the settlement made between the Mississippi Transportation Commission and Madison County that
resolved the above referenced litigation.

This is to request on behalf of the Mississippi Transportation Commission that the Board of Supervisors
of Madison County, at its next board meeting, place upon its minutes an acknowledgment that full and
final payment of the settlement agreement between the Board and the Commission has been received.

A copy of the board minutes showing the acknowledgment will be greatly appreciated.

Thank you very much for your courtesy and cooperation in this matter. If you have any questions,
please do not hesitate to call me.

Donid 18 Smith

Daniel B. Smith

cc: Lee Frederick, LPA Engineer

401 NORTH WEST STREET « P.O. BOX 1850 + JACKSON, MS 39215-1850
TELEPHONE (601) 359-7600 « FAX (601) 359-7774
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Timothy Bryan

Subject: FW: [Attor-Client Privileged Comm] Madison County Board of Supervisors v. Dick Hall
Final Payment Letter 106482

From: Na'Son White <Nason.White@madison-co.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 21, 2020 2:21 PM

To: Timothy Bryan <tim.bryan@madison-co.com>

Subject: RE: [Attor-Client Privileged Comm] Madison County Board of Supervisors v. Dick Hall Final Payment Letter
106482

Tim,
We received $42,157.88 from the State of MS on July 17, 2020.
Cordially,

Ni G S Wt

Madison County Board of Supervisors
Comptroller

P O Box 608

146 West Center Street

Canton, MS 39046

(601) 855-5580

From: Timothy Bryan <tim.bryan@madison-co.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 21, 2020 1:49 PM

To: Na'Son White <Nason.White@madison-co.com>

Subject: FW: [Attor-Client Privileged Comm] Madison County Board of Supervisors v. Dick Hall Final Payment Letter
106482

Can you verify that this payment has hit our account for the Reunion Parkway Lawsuit with MDOT?
Thanks,
Tim

From: Baker, Necole E. <nbaker@mdot.ms.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, July 21, 2020 1:42 PM

To: Timothy Bryan <tim.bryan@madison-co.com>

Cc: Frederick, Lee <Ifrederick@mdot.ms.gov>; Smith, Daniel B. <dbsmith@mdot.ms.gov>

Subject: FW: [Attor-Client Privileged Comm] Madison County Board of Supervisors v. Dick Hall Final Payment Letter
106482




CAUTION! External Content. Please use caution when opening
attachments and links. Do not provide your username and password if
requested.

Good afternoon! Did you receive your payment? The document number is CN581485 and payment number
3301561801 in the amount $42,157.88.

Do you know when we could expect the Board Minutes of the Board acknowledgement of the final payment of the
settlement agreement?

Thanks,

Necole Baker

LPA Office Coordinator

Mississippi Department of Transportation
Jackson, MS

nbaker@Mdot.ms.gov

601-359-7702




